



TENDER NO:

T2019/04

PROJECT NAME:

Water Meter Reading Services

CLOSING DATE:

30/03/2019

TIME:

12h30

OPENED BY:

Chethuwa

SIGNATURE:

WITNESS:

Tharozeni

SIGNATURE:

NAME OF THE ENTITY

AMOUNT

REMARKS

① Timanti Construction	2 707 659.36	
② SMK Supplies	No bid price	
③ Inkunzi Maintenance	No bid price	
④ Sibonimbali Group	9 274 500.00	
⑤ Shoynduka Enterprise	No bid price	
⑥ Fule Solutions	2 293 831.19	
⑦ Kontwela Exansi	9 235 25,89	
⑧ Leatha Trading	1 872 61,902	
⑨ Manuway Pty Ltd	3 173 940.00	
⑩ Zimbrey Trading	2 775 220	
⑪ Thatthas cc	5 278 570.55	
⑫ Shoynduka Ent.	8 544 035.23	
⑬ Umnothwako Pty Ltd	2 909 445.00	
⑭ Gutha Holdings	4 218 392.96	

AMAJUBA DISTRICT
MUNICIPALITY
PRIVATE BAG X 6615 89356, SECTION 1
NEWCASTLE MADADANI
2940 2061
TEL: 034 320 7200 FAX: 034 314 3785

Continuation of T2019/04

15. Leanoaway	6370 354.62
16. Suela Simandlaku	No bid price
17. Ipes - utility	2319 277.10
18. Calantra Trading	2567 935.00
19. Teatha Trading	4530 366.60
20. Fuzze Geomatics	2094 589.95
21. Londacorp Trading	3128 598.00
22. Jollyboyz Business	16752 656.63

No of documents received
for T2019/04 = 22